TOWNSHIP OF MORRIS

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

50 WOODLAND AVENUE
PO BOX 7603
CONVENT STATION, NEW JERSEY 07961-7603

(973) 326-7360
WWW.MORRISTWP.

M

BID NO. OTE 2024-03
COLLINSVILLE PLAYGROUND AND TUCKER FIELD IMPROVEMENT PROJECT

May 7, 2024 at 11

:00am

The following is a list of bids received for Bid No. OTE: 2024-03. All bids will be reviewed for accuracy and completeness. In accordance with the Local Public Contracts Law, NJSA 40A:11-1 et seq., an award
will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, or all bids will be rejected within 60 days, pursuant to NJSA 40A: 11-13.2.

PLAN HOLDER

ALTERNATE 1

ALTERNATE 2

ALTERNATE 3

LUMP SUM ALTERNATE 4 ALTERNATE 5

PRICE BASKETBALL DECORATIVE SOLAR PATHWAY

C LIGHTING FENCING LIGHTS ARCH BACKSTOP PARK BENCHES

AB CONTRACTING LLC $2,587,992.50 $130,000.00 $425,000.00 $200,000.00 $21,000.00 $30,000.00
APPLIED LANDSCAPE TECHNOLOGIES No Bid
ASPEN No Bid
CONSTRUCTION INFO SYSTEMS No Bid
CONSTRUCT CONNECT No Bid
DEMARTINIS LANDSCAPING INC No Bid
GIACORP CONTRACTING INC No Bid
GREEN VALLEY GROUP INC No Bid
KEYSTONE SPORTS CONSTRUCTION No Bid
THE LANDTEK GROUP INC $2,328,000.00 $85,000.00 $182,000.00 $85,000.00 $43,000.00 $25,000.00
PICERNO-GIORDANO $1,678,000.00 $108,000.00 $144,227.00 $123,744.00 $28,000.00 $10,770.00
PMY CONSTRUCTION CORP
REIVAX CONTRACTING CORP $1,518,353.00 $15,000.00 $171,500.00 $19,500.00 $25,000.00 $34,500.00
TURCO GOLF $2,612,228.20 $165,491.66 $138,564.86 $115,720.82 $53,968.62 $14,025.84
UNITED TERRAIN GROUP No Bid
THE VIERSMA COMPANIES No Bid
ROBERT W. WOGISCH LANDSCAPING No Bid
CONTRACTOR INC
ZENITH CONSTRUCTION SERVICES INC. $2,700.000.00 $80,000.00 $92,000.00 $80,000.00 $33,000.00 $15,000.00
Z TECH CONTRACTING LLC $1,996,257.00 $132,000.00 $142,986.00 $85,699.20 $41,278.74 $24,031.20
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